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FROM

$250 /NIGHT

Cracking View at
Eighty-Two
Port Victoria

Sleeps: 6

Bedrooms: 3

Bathrooms: 2

Parking spots: 4

Features:
•  1 king sized bed

•  1 queen sized bed

•  2 single beds

•  Airconditioning

•  Dishwasher

•  DVD player

•  Ensuite bathroom

•  Pet friendly

•  TV

•  Washing Machine

•  WiFi

•  Boat parking

•  Linen hire available

•  Beachfront

•  Bath

•  Fenced yard

•  Fish cleaning facilities

•  Coffee machine

•  Seaviews

* Price and property details correct as at 23/07/2025 and subject to change.
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Cracking View at Eighty-Two, Port Victoria

Cracking View at Eighty-Two is a beautifully
presented beachfront holiday house at Port Victoria,
offering stunning sea views of the Spencer Gulf and
across to Wardang Island. Ideally suited for families
or couples travelling together, this spacious
single-level holiday home accommodates up to 6
guests in comfort with everything needed for a
relaxing seaside getaway.

The holiday house features 3 bedrooms – a king
bedroom with ensuite, walk-in robe and
wall-mounted television, a queen bedroom, and a
third bedroom with 2 long single beds which can be
joined to form a king bed if required. Quilts, blankets
and pillows are provided, with guests needing to
bring their own sheets, pillowcases, towels, bathmats
and tea-towels or linen can be hired through the
Country Getaways office.

The master king bedroom includes a private ensuite
bathroom with a walk-in shower, double vanity, toilet
and a walk-in robe. The main bathroom offers a
bath, walk-in shower and vanity, with a separate
toilet and its own vanity for added convenience. Both
bathrooms are equipped with hairdryers.

Cracking View at Eighty-Two has ducted reverse
cycle air-conditioning throughout, along with ceiling
fans in each bedroom, the lounge room and dining

area, providing year-round comfort.

The spacious open plan living area includes a
comfortable lounge room, dining and a fully
equipped kitchen, all with direct sea views. Relax in
the recliner armchairs or enjoy the stunning views
with the telescope provided. The lounge room has a
large smart television with USB and HDMI ports, DVD
player, board games, CD player and WiFi access for
guest use.

The kitchen is well-equipped with a gas stovetop and
electric oven, dishwasher, large fridge with top
freezer, bar fridge, and a coffee machine (guests are
to bring their own beans or purchase locally), as well
as a stovetop percolator. The butler's pantry offers an
extensive range of appliances including kettle,
toaster, microwave, sandwich press, coffee grinder,
stick mixer, food processor, airfryer and multicooker,
along with a medium-size upright freezer. A large
dining table and bar stool seating at the kitchen
island complete the indoor entertaining space.

For guest convenience, Cracking View at Eighty-Two
includes a front load washing machine, iron, ironing
board, clothes airer and a pull-up clothesline.

Step outside to enjoy the undercover verandah and
outdoor entertaining area, complete with sea views
and café blinds for year-round use. A family Weber Q
and baby Weber Q gas barbecue are provided for
outdoor cooking, and guests can rinse off after a day
at the beach using the outdoor shower.

Pets are welcome inside at Cracking View at
Eighty-Two by prior arrangement with Country
Getaways. Just let the Country Getaways staff know
when making a booking if you would like to bring a
pet (no cats) with you for your stay.

The fenced rear yard offers a secure space for
children or pets, with off-street parking for 2 cars in
the driveway, and secure shed parking for a car and 1
boat. Additional parking is available in the fenced
rear yard for vehicles and a boat.

Cracking View at Eighty-Two enjoys an ideal location
with uninterrupted views and direct access to the
Walk The Yorke trail, with the marked path located
just across the road. The beach is a short stroll away,
while the Port Victoria jetty, museum and main street
shopping and dining options are just a 15-minute
walk or a quick drive from the property.

Located just over 2 hours' drive from Adelaide,
Cracking View at Eighty-Two is a great base to
explore Yorke Peninsula. In Port Victoria, enjoy fishing
from the jetty or boat, visit the Maritime Museum, or
grab a bite at the local hotel or foreshore kiosk.

Within an easy derive, discover Minlaton with its
cafés, bakery, shopping and attractions like the
Watsacowie Brewery, or visit Point Turton and its
sheltered beaches. Whether you are looking to relax
by the sea, enjoy coastal walks, or explore the
surrounding region, Cracking View at Eighty-Two in
Port Victoria is the perfect destination for your next
holiday.

* Price and property details correct as at 23/07/2025 and subject to change.


